RESOLUTION 11-80

A RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE THE PURCHASE
OF (2) NEW FOUR-WHEEL DRIVE SUVs FOR THE POLICE
DEPARTMENT

WHEREAS, the Spring Hill Police Department is in need of new vehicles;
and

WHEREAS, the City of Spring Hill included 2 new four-wheel drive
SUVs in the budget for fiscal year 2011-2012; and

WHEREAS, the City of Spring Hill advertised and accepted bids from
vendors on July 28, 2011; and

WHEREAS, City Staff has reviewed all proposals and has made a
recommendation to the Budget Finance Advisory Committee; and

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the City of Spring Hill
authorizes the purchase of 2 new four-wheel drive SUVs from GM of
Murfreesboro for a total cost of $58,270.00, as recommended by the Budget and
Finance Advisory Committee on August 8, 2011.

Passed and adopted by the Board of Mayor and Aldermen of the City
of Spring Hill, Tennessee on the 15" day of August, 2011.
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"Michael Dinwiddie, Mayor

ATTEST:

April Goad, City Recorder
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CITY OF SPRING HILL POLICE DEPARTMENT TWO 4WD SUV VEHICLE PROPOSAL MATRIX
RECEIVED JULY 28, 2011
SUMMARY OF EVALUATIONS
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Committee
J=Jim Smith
G=April Goad

E=Cory England
C=Don Brite or Jason Fogle
S=Charlie Spires

Qualification/Experience
#1 Walker-Not addressed

#2 Lyons-Not addressed

#3 GM M Boro- Not addressed
#4 Sloan-Not addressed

References

#1 Walker-Not addressed

#2 Lyons-Not addressed
#3GM M Boro- Not addressed
#4 Sloan-Not addressed

Stability / Long Term Viability
#1 Walker-Not addressed

#2 Lyons-Not addressed
#3GM M Boro- Not addressed
#4 Sloan-Not addressed




Adherence to Technical Specs.

#1 Walker-Does not comly with Police Pursuit vehicle but does comply with Adenda Special Service vehicle, color black or mocha steel mettalic noted

Del. 60 - 90 days after ordered following production date of Aug. 8th.

#2 Lyons-All modules checked complied with except color, note stating color showing not available at this time, may be at production time. Del 6 -8
weeks after ordered.

#3 GM M Boro- Does not comply with Police Pursuit but does comply with Adenda Special Service vehicle, requested color not available. Del. 100 day after ord:
#4 Sloan- Not full size Police Pursuit rated vehicle, did not address Adenda as to Special Service vehicle.

Pricing

#1 Walker-$29,147.00 per vehicle / Total $58,294.00

#2 Lyons-$32,035.25 per vehicle / Total $64,070.50

#3 GM M Boro-$29,135.00 per vehicle / Tc Total $58,270.00
#4 Sloan-$29,396 per vehicle / Total $58,792.00

Photos /data

#1 Walker-No photos, SPECS attached

#2 Lyons-No attachments

#3 GM M Boro-No photos, SPECS attached
#4 Sloan-No attachments



SUMMARY OF BIDS
SPRING HILL POLICE DEPARTMENT

VEHICLES
THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2011
COMPANY (2) 4WD SUVS (6) PURSUIT VEHICLES (1) 2WD SUV
‘Walker Chevrolet $ 58,294.00 | $ 130,501.98 26,616.00
MAKE/MODEL/YR Chevy/Tahoe/2012 Chevy/Impala/2012 Chevy/Tahoe/2012
‘Wilson County Motors NO BID $ 130,152.00 NO BID
MAKE/MODEL/YR N/A Chevy/Impala/2012 N/A
Lyons Chevrolet $ 64,070.50 | $ 126,652.20 26,147.77
MAKE/MODEL/YR Chevy/Tahoe/2012 Chevy/Impala/2012 Chevy/Tahoe/2012
GM of Murfreesboro $ 58,270.00 | $ 123,246.00 27,188.00
MAKE/MODEL/YR Chevy/Tahoe/2012 Chevy/Impala/2012 Chevy/Tahoe/2012
Ted Russell Auto Group NO BID $ 142,128.00 NO BID
MAKE/MODEL/YR N/A Ford/Taurus/2013 N/A
Sloan Ford $ 58,792.00 | $ 142,620.00 29,698.00
MAKE/MODEL/YR Ford/Expedition/2012 Ford/Inceptors/2013 Ford/Expedition/2012
Stan McNabb NO BID NO BID 27,344.00
MAKE/MODEL/YR N/A N/A Chevy/Tahoe/2012
Cardinal Chrysler NO BID $ 143,372.16 NO BID
MAKE/MODEL/YR N/A Dodge/Charger/2012 N/A




