
RESOLUTION 11-79 

A RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE THE PURCHASE
 
OF (6) NEW POLICE PURSUIT VEHICLES
 

WHEREAS, the Spring Hill Police Department is in need of new vehicles; 
and 

WHEREAS, the City of Spring Hill included 6 police pursuit vehicles in 
the budget for fiscal year 2011-2012; and 

WHEREAS, the City of Spring Hill advertised and accepted bids from 
vendors on July 28,2011; and 

WHEREAS, City Staff has reviewed all proposals and has made a 
recommendation to the Budget Finance Advisory Committee; and 

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the City of Spring Hill 
authorizes the purchase of 6 new police pursuit vehicles from GM of 
Murfreesboro for a total cost of $123,246.00, as recommended by the Budget and 
Finance Advisory Committee on August 8, 2011. 

Passed and adopted by the Board of Mayor and Aldermen of the City 
of Spring Hill, Tennessee on the 15th day of August, 2011. 

ATTEST: 

LEGAL FORM APPROVED:
 



CITY OF SPRING HILL POLICE DEPARTMENT SIX PURSUIT VEHICLES PROPOSAL MATRIX
 
RECEIVED JULY 28, 2011
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Committee 

J=Jim Smith 
G=April Goad 
E=Cory England 
C=Don Brite or Jason Fogle 
S=Charlie Spires 

Qualification/Experience 
#1 Walker Chev. - Not addressed 

#2 Wilson Co. Chev. - Not addressed 
#3 Lyons Chev. - Not addressed 
#4 GM M Boro - Not addressed 
#5 Ted Russell Ford - Not addressed 
#6 Sloan Ford - Not addressed 
#7 Cardinal Dodge - Not addressed 

References 
#1 Walker Chev. - Not addressed 
#2 Wilson Co. Chev. - Not addressed 
#3 Lyons Chev. - Not addressed 
#4 GM M Boro - Not addressed 
#5 Ted Russell Ford - Not addressed 
#6 Sloan Ford - Not addressed 



#7 Cardinal Dodge - Not addressed
 

Stability' Long Term Viability
 
#1 Walker Chev. - Not addressed
 
#2 Wilson Co. Chev. - Not addressed
 
#3 Lyons Chev. - Not addressed
 
#4 GM M Boro - Not addressed
 
#5 Ted Russell Ford - Not addressed
 
#6 Sloan Ford - Not addressed
 
#7 Cardinal Dodge - Not addressed
 

Adherence to Technical Specs.
 
#1 Walker Chev. - Complied with all modules, delivery 60-90 days after production date of Aug. 29th
 
#2 Wilson Co. Chev. - Complied with all modules, estimated delivery date is 75-100 days after ordered.
 
#3 Lyons Chev. - Complied with all modules, delivery 6-8 weeks after ordered.
 
#4 GM M Boro - Complied with all modules, delivery 90 days after ordered.
 
#5 Ted Russell Ford - # 22 no answer, complied with all other modules, 1st quarter of 2012 delivery.
 
#6 Sloan Ford - # 5,6,45 no answer, all other modules complied with, available 1st quarter of 2012.
 
#7 Cardinal Dodge - # 6 does not comply, all other modules complied with, delivery 6-8 weeks.
 

Pricing
 
#1 Walker Chev. - $21,750.33 per vehicle' Total $130,501.98.
 
#2 Wilson Co. Chev. - $21,692.00 per vehicle' Total $130,152.00.
 
#3 Lyons Chev. - $21,108.70 per vehicle' Total $126,652.20.
 
#4 GM M Boro - $20,541.00 per vehicle' Total $123,246.00.
 
#5 Ted Russell Ford - $23,688.00 per vehicle' Total $142,128.00.
 
#6 Sloan Ford - $23,770.00 per vehicle' Total $142,620.00.
 
#7 Cardinal Dodge - $23,895.36 per vehicle' Total $143,372.16.
 

Photos 'data
 
#1 Walker Chev. - No photos, SPECS attached.
 
#2 Wilson Co. Chev. - Color photos, and SPECS attached.
 
#3 Lyons Chev. - No attachments.
 
#4 GM M Boro - No photos, SPECS attached.
 
#5 Ted Russell Ford - No photos, some SPECS attached.
 
#6 Sloan Ford - No attachments.
 
#7 Cardinal Dodge - No photos, SPECS attached.
 



SUMl\1ARY OF BIDS
 
SPRING HILL POLICE DEPARTMENT
 

VEIDCLES
 
THURSDAY, JULY 28,2011
 

COMPANY (2)4WD SUVS (6) PURSUIT VEHICLES (1)2WD SUV 

Walker Chevrolet 

MAKEIMODELlYR 

$ 58,294.00 

Chevy/Tahoe/2012 

$ 130,501.98 

Chevy/Impa1a12012 

$ 26,616.00 

Chevy/Tahoe12012 

Wilson County Motors 

MAKEIMODELlYR 

NO BID 

N/A 

$ 130,152.00 

Chevy/Impa1a12012 

NO BID 

N/A 

Lyons Chevrolet 

MAKEIMODELlYR 

$ 64,070.50 

Chevy/Tahoe/2012 

$ 126,652.20 

Chevy/Impa1a120 12 

$ 26,147.77 

Chevy/Tahoe/2012 

GM of Murfreesboro 

MAKEIMODELlYR 

$ 58,270.00 

Chevy/Tahoe/2012 

$ 123,246.00 

Chevy/Impa1a12012 

$ 27,188.00 

Chevy/Tahoe/2012 

Ted Russell Auto Group 

MAKEIMODELlYR 

NO BID 

N/A 

$ 142,128.00 

Ford/Taurus12013 

NO BID 

N/A 

Sloan Ford 

MAKEIMODELlYR 

$ 58,792.00 

Ford/Expedition12012 

$ 142,620.00 

Ford/Inceptors12013 

$ 29,698.00 

Ford/Expedition12012 

Stan McNabb 

MAKEIMODELIYR 

NO BID 

N/A 

NO BID 

N/A 

$ 27,344.00 

Chevy/Tahoe/2012 

Cardinal Chrysler 

MAKEIMODELlYR 

NO BID 

N/A 

$ 143,372.16 

Dodge/Charger12012 

NO BID 

N/A 


