
RESOLUTION 10-103 

A RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE THE PURCHASE 
OF POLICE VEHICLES 

WHEREAS, the Police Department IS 10 need of vehicles for 
administrative, K-9/investigative purposes; and 

WHEREAS, the City of Spring Hill approved funding of police vehicles in 
the 2010-2011 Capital Improvement Plan; and 

WHEREAS, the City of Spring Hill advertised and accepted proposals 
from qualified vendors on September 30,2010 ; and 

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the City of Spring Hill 
authorizes the purchase of the following vehicles from Lyons Chevrolet as listed: 

2011 Chevy Tahoe 2 Wheel Drive $24,997.00 
2011 Chevy Pickup Truck 314 Ton, 4x4. $25,865.00 

Total $50,862.00 

Passed and adopted by the Board of Mayor and Aldermen of the City 
of Spring Hill, Tennessee on the 18th day of October 2010. 

ATTEST: 



RFP Results
 

Police Vehicles
 

SUVs and Trucks
 

Thursday, September 30, 2010 

3:00 P.M. 

Staff present were: Chief Don Brite, Assistant Chief Jason Fogle, Lt. Shauna Dooley, and 

April Goad, City Recorder. 

Pickup Truck Pickup Truck 
1/2 Ton 3/4 Ton SUV SUV 

Crew Cab Crew Cab 4WD 2WD 

Alexander Automotive Family $ 25,843.00 4WD $ 24,598.00 4WD $ 28,372.00 $ 25,359.00 

Cardinal Chrysler Jeep Dodge $ 23,636.15 ** $ 26,904.41 ** No Bid No Bid 

Freeland Chevrolet $ 26,038.00 4WD $ 27,049.00 4WD $ 30,634.00 $ 27,098.00 

Heritage Automotive No Bid 1$ 27,995.00 4WD No Bid $ 28,997.00 

Lyons Chevrolet No Bid $ 25,865.00 4WD No Bid $ 24,997.00 

Sloan Ford $ 26,839.00 4WD $ 24,463.00 4WD $ 29,847.00 No Bid 

Tom Bannen Chevrolet No Bid $ 24,556.00 2WD $ 28,665.00 $ 25,802.00 
-

Town and Country Ford No Bid No Bid $ 24,588,_00 $ 26,710.00 

Walker Chevrolet $ 25,780.00 4WD $ 26,557.00 4WD No Bid $ 25,610.00 

Brand: 

Chevrolet 

Ford 

Dodge 

** Does not meet specifications 



Installation for (6) six 2011 Chevy Impalas 

Equipment needs (Prefer Whelen brand, but Federal, CODE3 or well known brand 
acceptable): 

Clear or Blue LEDS corner strobes in front headlights 
Headlight Flasher 
Front Interior takedown Iightbar 
Rear Interior Iightbar 
Siren control with slide and push button controls, PA system 
Speaker, 100 watt 
Outlet 3 hole wI breaker separate or made with console 
Streamlight SL20X LED rechargeable flashlight 
2 rear deck lights (single talons, or similar) 
Push bumber, no wraparound 
2 lights for push bumper, round or square 
2 LED lights for side of vehicle, similar to talon or tier6 
2 LED lights for under side mirrors, similar to tier3 size 
Solid, sturdy console, prefer Havis Shield, Gamber, etc. with cup holders 
Quote armrest separately if possible 
Vertical Dual gun rack for AR1S/870, preferably Patriot GR6 
Partition, preferably Patriot, but Setina or like okay, with center horizontal 
slide glass 
Extended plate for Partition 
Any brackets, rubber housing, screws, misc. materials needed for installation 

Installation 
Install all the above 
InstaJi Kenwood Radio with antenna, external speaker 
Install Stalker Radar, with front and rear antenna 
Install Digital Ally Camera System 
Prefer breaker system as opposed to fuses 

Set Up 
Switch one is for rear and side lights 
Switch two front, rear and side 
Switch three all lights and siren 
Horn on steering column alters siren tone when depressed 
Radio comes on/offwith ignition 
Radar wiU be powered on I off by officer 
Gun rack hooked to control panel for unlocking 
Gun Rack mounted between seats 
Side LED lights mounted to cage or similar 
LED lights win be mounted under side mirrors at a slight outward angle 
Streamlight charger to be mounted to side of console or passenger side dash 
near glovebox 



Rear deck lights mounted to rear deck 
Rear interior Iightbar mounted to upper rear windshield 
Front interior Iightbar to be mounted to upper front windshield 
Tail light Flasher should be connected 
Camera system should come on with ignition 
A computer mount will be installed by another source to the passenger side 
seat brackets 

Installation for (1) one Chevy Tahoe K-9 vehicle 

Equipment needs (Prefer Whelen brand, but Federal, CODE3 or well known brand 
acceptable): 

Push Bumper with wrap around 
2 LEDs flush mount for sides of push bumper, preferably size of Tier3 
Console, prefer Havis Shield, Gamber or like with cup holders, armrest 
Vertical Dual Gun rack for AR15/870, to be rear cargo mounted 
American Aluminum K9 cage/partition, K9 on passenger side 
American Aluminum rubber mat 
Interior Front Lightbar with takedown 
2 rear side LED lights, preferably size of single talons/Tier6 
2 LED lights for side mirrors, preferably Tier3 size 
2 LED flush mount lights for rear tailgate, preferably size of Tier6/ 4", round 
or square 
2 Blue LED headlight strobes 
Headlight Flashers, with tail light flashers 
Rear interior Iightbar similar to Dominator Iightbar 
Siren control with slide and push button controls 
Speaker, 100 watt 
3 hole outlet with breaker, unless it comes with console 
Streamlight SL20X LED rechargeable flashlight 

Installation 
Install all the above 
Install Stalker Radar with front and rear antennas 
Install Kenwood Radio with antenna and external speaker 
Install Digital Ally Camera system 
Prefer breaker system as opposed to fuses 
Install Ray Allen Heat Alarm 
Install Dominator Iightbar on push bumper 

Set Up 
Switch one is for rear and side lights 
Switch two front, rear and side 
Switch three all lights and siren 
Horn on steering column alters siren tone when depressed 



Radio will be powered on I off by officer 
Radar will be powered on I off by officer 
Dual gun rack needs to have lock release in rear of vehicle for deployment of 
weapons 
Side LED lights mounted inside of rear cargo windows of vehicle 
LED lights will be mounted on side mirrors 
Streamlight charger to be mounted to side of console or passenger side dash 
near glovebox 
2 LED lights mounted to rear tailgate 
Rear interior Iightbar mounted to upper rear windshield 
Front interior Iightbar to be mounted to upper front windshield 
Taillight Flasher should be connected 
Camera system should come on with ignition 
A computer mount will be installed by another source to the passenger side 
seat brackets 
Any brackets, rubber housing, screws, misc. materials needed for installation 

Installation for (1) one Crew Cab Pickup Truck 

Equipment needs (Prefer Whelen brand, but Federal, CODE3 or well known brand 
acceptable): 

4 Blue LEDS corner strobes in front headlights and reverse lights 
2 LED lights for front grille, preferably Talonffier6 size 
2 LED strobes for center taillight 
Headlight Flasher, taillight flashers 
Front Interior takedown lightbar 
Rear Interior Iightbar or something similar to Dominator Iightbar 
Undercover siren hand held control, preferably Whelen 
Speaker, 100 watt 
Outlet 3 hole wi breaker 
Streamlight SL20X LED rechargeable flashlight 
2 LED lights for side of vehicle (single talons, or similar) 
Any brackets, rubber housing, screws, misc. materials needed for installation 

Installa tion 
Install all the above 
Install Kenwood Radio with antenna and external speaker 
Install Digital Ally Camera system 
Prefer breaker system as opposed to fuses 

SetUp 
Switch one is for rear and side lights 
Switch two front, rear and side 
Switch three all lights and siren 
Horn on steering column alters siren tone when depressed 
Radio comes on/offwith ignition 



2 LED lights mounted within rear center taillight above cab 
Side LED lights mounted inside of vehicle out from rear passenger area 
2 LED lights will be mounted inside grille area 
Streamlight charger to be mounted to side of console or passenger side dash 
near glovebox 
Rear interior Iightbar mounted to upper rear windshield 
Front interior lightbar to be mounted to upper front windshield 
Taillight Flasher should be connected 
A computer mount will be installed by another source to the passenger side 
seat brackets 

FOR ALL VEHICLES ABOVE 

All equipment quoted must have Manufacturer Name and part number listed. 

The company must be willing to send any equipment under warranty (that was 
purchased through you) back to the manufacturer for replacement. If any fees 
apply to these please note them. 

Explanation of warranty and number of years 

Turn around time per vehicle 

Wiring must be as follows: 
All wiring soldered 
Heat Shrink over soldered connection points 
No butt connectors 
No electrical tape 
No crimp connectors 
8 gauge wiring for ground and power 
No smaller than 14 gauge wiring for speaker wire or grille/deck lights 
All exposed wiring must be covered with black wire loom 
All hidden wiring must be wire tied appropriately. 



PROPOSAL ADVERTISEMENT 

The City of Spring Hill is requesting proposals from certified installers for purchase of 
equipment and installation of said equipment.. Firms are invited to submit a proposal 
outlining equipment and installation costs and procedures as outlined on the specification 
sheet. 

Sealed proposals will be received until 3:00 pm on October 22, 2010 by Lt. Shauna 
Dooley, at the Spring Hill Police Department, 199 Town Center Parkway, Spring Hill, 
TN 37174. Facsimile or email proposals will not be accepted. Proposals will not be 
accepted after the stated opening date and time. Late proposals will be returned to the 
vendor unopened. For a copy of specifications please contact Lt. Shauna Dooley at 931­
486-2252 ext 244 or email sdooley@springhilltn.org . 

Date: October 6,2010 


