City of Spring Hill
199 Town Center Parkway
P.O. Box 789

Spring Hill, TN 37174
Phone 931-486-2252 Ext. 211
Fax: 931-486-3596

Residential Design Standards

Adopted Ordinance 14-10 adopted April 21, 2014

SECTION R101 General
R 101.1 Title. These provisions shall be known as the Residential Code for One- and Two-family

Dwellings of -INAME-OFJIJRISBICHON], City of Spring Hill and shall be cited as such and will be referred
to herein as "this code."

SECTION R105 PERMITS

R105.1 Required. Any owner or authorized agent who intends to construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move,
demolish or change the occupancy of a building or structure, or to erect, install, enlarge, alter, repair,
remove, convert or replace any electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system, the installation of which
is regulated by this code, or to cause any such work to be done, shall first make application to the
building official and obtain the required permit.

R105.2 Work exempt from permit. Permits shall not be required for the following. Exemption from
permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in
any manner in violation of the provisions of this code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction.

Building:

. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar uses,

provided the floor area does not exceed 200-sguarefeet 32 square ft.

2. Fences not over Heet{2434-mm} 32 inches high.

3. Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet in height measured from the bottom of the footing to the top of

© ©° N oG

the wall, unless supporting a surcharge.

Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons (18 927 L) and
the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2 to 1.

Sidewalks and driveways.

Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish work.

Prefabricated swimming pools that are less than 24 inches (610 mm) deep.

Swings and other playground equipment.

Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which do not project more than 54 inches (1372 mm)
from the exterior wall and do not require additional support.



10.

11.

> e

City of Spring Hill Spring Hill, TN 37174
199 Town Center Parkway Phone 931-486-2252 Ext. 211
P.O. Box 789 Fax: 931-486-3596

Decks not exceeding 200-sguarefeet 9 square feet in area, that are not more than 30 inches (762 mm)
above grade at any point, are not attached to a dwelling and do not serve the exit door required by
Section R311.4.

Roof covering replacement that does not involve the replacement of the roof deck or framing.
Mechanical:

Portable ventilation appliances.

Portable cooling units.

unsafe: Replacement of an HVAC unit where unit heating and cooling capacity and fuel source are not
changed.
Portable evaporative coolers.

R105.3.2 Time limitation of application. An application for a permit for any proposed work shall be
deemed to have been abandoned 180-days 365 days after the date of filing unless such application has
been pursued in good faith or a permit has been issued; except that the building official is authorized to
grant one or more extensions of time for additional periods not exceeding 380-days 365 days each. The
extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.

SECTION R313 AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS
R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems. An automatic residential fire sprinkler system
shall be installed in townhouses.

Exception: An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required when additions or
alterations are made to existing townhouses that do not have an automatic residential fire sprinkler
system installed.

R313.1.1 Design and installation. Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems for townhouses shall
be designed and installed in accordance with Section P2904.

R313.2 One-and-two-family dwellings automatic fire systems. An automatic residential fire sprinkler
system shall be installed in ere—and-two-family dwellings.

Exception: An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required for additions or
alterations to existing buildings that are not already provided with an automatic residential sprinkler
system.



City of Spring Hill Spring Hill, TN 37174
199 Town Center Parkway Phone 931-486-2252 Ext. 211
P.O. Box 789 Fax: 931-486-3596

SECTION R317 PROTECTION OF WOOD AND WOOD BASED PRODUCTS AGAINST DECAY
R317.1 Location required. Protection of wood and wood based products from decay shall be provided
in the following locations by the use of naturally durable wood or wood that is preservative-treated in

accordance with AWPA U 1 for the species, product, preservative and end use. Preservatives shall be
listed in Section 4 of AWPA U 1.

1. Wood joists or the bottom of a wood structural floor when closer than 18-inches{457-mm} 24
inches or wood girders when closer than 32-rehes{3085+m} 24 inches to the exposed ground in
crawl spaces or unexcavated area located within the periphery of the building foundation.

2. All wood framing members that rest on concrete or masonry exterior foundation walls and are
less than 8 inches (203 mm) from the exposed ground.

3. Sills and sleepers on a concrete or masonry slab that is in direct contact with the ground unless
separated from such slab by an impervious moisture barrier.

4. The ends of wood girders entering exterior masonry or concrete walls having clearances of less
than 1linch (12.7 mm) on tops, sides and ends.

5. Wood siding, sheathing and wall framing on the exterior of a building having a clearance of less
than 6 inches (152 mm) from the ground or less than 2 inches (51 mm) measured vertically
from concrete steps, porch slabs, patio slabs, and similar horizontal surfaces exposed to the
weather.

6. Wood structural members supporting moisture-permeable floors or roofs that are exposed
to the weather, such as concrete or masonry slabs, unless separated from such floors or
roofs by an impervious moisture barrier.

7. Wood furring strips or other wood framing members attached directly to the interior of exterior
masonry walls or concrete walls below grade except where an approved vapor retarder is
applied between the wall and the furring strips or framing members.

R403.3.3 Drainage. Final grade shall be sloped in accordance with Section R401.3. In other
than Group | Soils, as detailed in Table R405.1, two (2) inches of gravel or crushed stone beneath
horizontal (class 1) retarder insutatien-below ground shall have a 3 inch drain to daylight or into
an approved sewer-system.



City of Spring Hill
199 Town Center Parkway

Spring Hill, TN 37174
Phone 931-486-2252 Ext. 211

P.O. Box 789 Fax: 931-486-3596
TABLE R602.3(5)
SIZE, HEIGHT AND SPACING OF WOOD STUDS"
BEARING WALLS NONBEARING WALLS
::::L"e".l;m .';pri:i(:ng Maximum spacing Maximum spacing
STUD SIZE Laterally roof—gzllln 92| when supporting one | when supporting two | Maximum spacing Laterally Maximum
{inches) unsupported bi rg fioor, plus a roof- floors, plus a roof- when supporting unsupported spacin
stud height® ﬁ:ﬁi’:m::ni ceiling assembly or a | ceiling assembly ora | one floor height® | stud height® (iﬁchesg]
(feet) ! bl o n'i habitable attic habitable attic (feet) (feet)
assembly, only assembly (inches) assembly (inches)
(inches)
2x3" — e — — - 10 16
2x4 10 24¢ 16° — 24 14 24
Ix4 10 24 24 16 24 J 14 24
2x5 10 24 24 — 24 16 24
| 2x6 10 24 ' 24 16 24 20 24

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, | foot = 304.8 mm, | square foot = 0.093 m’.
a. Listed heights are distances between points of lateral support placed perpendicular to the plane of the wall.
where justified by analysis.

Increases in unsupported height are permitted
b. Shall not be used in exterior walls,

¢. A habitable attic assembly supported by 2 x 4 studs is limited to a roof span of 32 feet. Where the roof span exceeds 32 feet, the wall studs shall be increased
to 2 % 6 or the studs shall be designed in accordance with accepted engineering practice.

Table R602.3 (5) Size, Height and Spacing of Wood Studs is amended by, All columns that reflects
24 is deleted and replaced with 16.

R602.5 Interior nonbearing walls. Interior nonbearing walls shall be permitted to be
constructed with 2 inch by 3 inch (51 mm by 76 mm) studs-spaced-24-irches{610-rw} studs spaced 16
inches on center or, when not part of a braced wall line, 2 inch by 4 inch (51 mm by 102 mm) flat studs
spaced at 16 inches (406 mm) on center. Interior nonbearing walls shall be capped with at least a single
top plate. Interior nonbearing walls shall be fire blocked in accordance with Section R602.8.

R602.7.3 Nonbearing walls. Load-bearing headers are not required in interior or exterior nonbearing

exteriorhonbearirg-wals a double 2-inch by 4-inch (102mm by 204mm) member on edge may be used
as a header in interior or exterior nonbearing walls for openings up to 8 feet (2438 mm) in width if the
vertical distance to the parallel nailing surface above is not more than 24 inches (610 mm). For such

nonbearing headers, no cripples or blocking are required above the header.

R703.11.1 Installation. Vinyl siding, soffit and accessories shall be installed in accordance with the
manufacturer's installation instructions. Vinyl siding shall be installed over solid OSB sheathing.



City of Spring Hill Spring Hill, TN 37174
199 Town Center Parkway Phone 931-486-2252 Ext. 211
P.O. Box 789 Fax: 931-486-3596

R802.3 Framing details. Rafters shall be framed to ridge board or to each other with a gusset plate as
a tie. Ridge board shall be at least 1-inch (25 mm) nominal thickness and not less in depth than the cut
end of the rafter. At all valleys and hips there shall be a valley or hip rafter not less than 2-inch (51 mm)
nominal thickness and not less in depth than the cut end of the rafter. Hip and valley rafters shall be
supported at the ridge by a brace to a bearing partition or be designed to carry and distribute the
specific load at that point. Where the roof pitch is less than three units vertical in 12 units horizon- tal
(25-percent slope), structural members that support rafters and ceiling joists, such as ridge beams, hips
and valleys, shall be designed as beams. All primary roofline structure design shall maintain a minimum
of a 6:12 pitch, exclusive of dormers and porches, eaves shall have one foot minimum overhang.

R807.1 Attic access. Buildings with combustible ceiling or roof construction shall have an attic access
opening to attic areas that exceed 30 square feet (2.8 m2) and have a vertical height of 30 inches (762
mm) or greater. The vertical height shall be measured from the top of the ceiling framing members to
the underside of the roof framing members.

The rough-framed opening shall not be less than 22 inches by 30 inches (559 mm by 762 mm)
and shall be located in a hallway or other readily accessible location. When located in a wall, the
opening shall be a minimum of 22 inches wide by 30 inches high (559 mm wide by 762 mm high). When
the access is located in a ceiling, minimum unobstructed head- room in the attic space shall be 30 inches
(762 mm) at some point above the access measured vertically from the bottom of ceiling framing
members. See Section M1305.1.3 for access requirements where mechanical equipment is located in
attics. Attics that contain HVAC equipment or appliances must provide permanent assess by means of
either a (25inches by 54inches) pull down stair or permanent ladder.

R903.4 Roof drainage. Unlessroofsare sloped-te-drainoverroofedges; roof drains shall be installed

at each low point of the roof.

R903.4.1 Secondary (emergency overflow) drains or scuppers. Where roof drains are required,
secondary emergency overflow roof drains or scuppers shall be pro- vided where the roof perimeter
construction extends above the roof in such a manner that water will be entrapped if the primary drains
allow buildup for any reason. Overflow drains having the same size as the roof drains shall be installed
with the inlet flow line located 2 inches (51 mm) above the low point of the roof, or overflow scuppers
having three times the size of the roof drains and having a minimum opening height of 4 inches (102
mm) shall be installed in the adjacent parapet walls with the inlet flow located 2 inches (51 mm) above
the low point of the roof served. The installation and sizing of overflow drains, leaders and conductors
shall comply with Sections 1106 and 1108 as applicable of the International Plumbing Code.

Overflow drains shall discharge to an approved location and shall not be connected to roof drain lines.



City of Spring Hill Spring Hill, TN 37174
199 Town Center Parkway Phone 931-486-2252 Ext. 211
P.O. Box 789 Fax: 931-486-3596

2012 International Residential Code

: c Cfics Delati . L oty

Substituted with the following: 2009 International Energy Conservation Code

SECTION M1805 MASONRY AND FACTORY-BUILT CHIMNEYS

M1805.1 General. Masonry and factory-built chimneys shall be built and installed in accordance with
Sections RI003 and R 1005, respectively. Flue lining for masonry chimneys shall comply with Section
R1003.11. The City of Spring Hill requires all fireplaces chimneys to be in a chase with the same
materials as the home.



ORDINANCE 14-10

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE ADOPTED 2012 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL
CODE OF
THE CITY OF SPRING HILL, TENNESSEE

WHEREAS, the City of Spring Hill Board of Mayor and Aldermen may, pursuant to its charter and
general laws of the State of Tennessee to amend the Spring Hill Municipal Code for the purpose of
promoting the public health, safety, morals, convenience, order, prosperity, and general welfare of the
community;

BE IT THEREFORE ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF MAYOR AND ALDERMEN OF
THE CITY OF SPRING HILL, TENNESSEE that the adopted 2012 International Residential be
amended as hereafter described.

WHEREAS, it is necessary to amend said chapters 1, 3,4, 6, 7, 8,9, 11, & 18 in order to adopt new and
improved building standards to better protect the public health, safety and welfare.

WHEREAS, The 2012 International Residential Code is hereby specifically amended, modified, or deleted
as follows:

Section R101.1 is amended by deleting the phrase “[name of jurisdiction]” and substituting in lieu thereof
the phrase “the City of Spring Hill, Tennessee.”

Section R105.2 on building work exempted from the permit requirement is amending exemptions 1, 2,
9 and 10 and adding 11 substituting in lieu thereof the following:

1. Portable one-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds,
playhouses and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 32 square feet.

2. Fences not over 32 inches high.

Section R105.2 on Mechanical work exempted from the permit requirement is amended by deleting text
and adding the following;:

9. Replacement of an HV AC unit where unit heating and cooling capacity and fuel source are not changed.
10. Decks not exceeding 9 square feet in area that are not more than 30 inches above grade at any point.
11. Roof covering replacement that does not involve the replacement of the roof deck or framing.

R105.3.2 Time limitation of application; is amended by deleting 180 days and replacing it with 365 days
to read. An application for a permit for any proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 365
days after the date of filing unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a permit has been
issued; except that the building official is authorized to grant one or more extensions of time for additional
periods not exceeding 365 days each. The extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause
demonstrated.

Ordinance 14-10
April 21, 2014
Page I of 3



Section R313.2 is amended by deleting, one-family.

Section R317 Protection of Wood and Wood Based Products Against Decay; is amended deleting 18
inches and replacing with 24 inches and deleting 12 inches and replacing it with 24 inches to read as below.
Wood joists or the bottom of a wood structural floor when closer than 24 inches (553 mm) or wood girders
when closer than 24 inches (553 mm) to the exposed ground in crawl spaces or unexcavated area located
within the periphery of the building foundation.

R403.3.3 Drainage. Is amended by adding text to read, Final grade shall be sloped in accordance with
Section R401.3. In other than Group I Soils, as detailed in Table R405.1 two (2) inches of gravel or
crushed stone beneath horizontal (class 1) retarder below ground shall have a 3 inch drain to daylight or
into an approved system.

TABLE R602.3 (5) Size, Height and Spacing of Wood Studs is amended by; All columns that reflect 24
is deleted and replaced with 16

Section R602.5 Interior nonbearing walls is amended by deleting studs spaced 24 inches; replaced with
studs spaced16 inches

R602.7.3 Nonbearing walls is amended by deleting the text; a single flat 2-inch by 4-inch (51 mm by 102
mm) member may be used as a header in interior or exterior nonbearing walls; replacing it with, a double
2-inch by 4-inch (102 mm by 204 mm) member on edge may be used as a header in interior or exterior
nonbearing walls.

R703.11.1 Installation. Vinyl siding is amended by adding text, vinyl siding shall be installed over solid
OSB sheathing;

R802.3 Framing details is amended by adding text to the end of the paragraph, All primary roofline
structure design shall maintain a minimum of a 6:12 pitch, exclusive of dormers and porches, eaves shall
have a one foot minimum overhang.

Section R807.1 attic access is amended by adding the following text at the end of the section’s second
paragraph: “Attics that contain HVAC equipment or appliances must provide permanent access by means
of either a (25 inches by 54 inches) pull-down stair or permanent ladder.”

R903.4 Roof drainage is amended by deleting the text “Unless roofs are sloped to drain over roof edges”,
to read “Roof drains shall be installed at each low point of the roof.”

Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency is amended deleting the chapter’s text in its entirety and in lieu thereof
substituting the following:

The 2009 International Energy Conservation Code

Ordinance 14-10
April 21, 2014
Page 2 of 3



SECTION M1805 Masonry and Factory-Built Chimneys is amended by adding:

M1805.1.1 The City of Spring Hill requires all fireplace chimneys to be in a chase constructed with the
same materials as the exterior of the structure or other materials approved by the Building Codes Director.

BE IT FUTHER ENACTED by the Board of Mayor and Aldermen of the City of Spring Hill that
ordinance shall take effect from and after its final passage, the public welfare requiring it.

Passed First Reading March 17, 2014

Passed Second Reading April 21, 2014 M/

{} Ri raham, Mayor
ATTﬂ /QM

Apri}s.doad, City Recorder

Ordinance 14-10
April 21, 2014
Page 3 of 3



	Design Standards
	Ordinance 14-10, to amend the adopted 2012 International Residential Code

